S

Fowel §
TfsRe | S=et I=[<90



UNIVERSAL DECLARATION OF HUMAN RIGHTS.

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT TO LIFE, LIBERTY
AND SECURITY OF PERSON. ---- Article 3

NO ONE SHALIL BE SUBJECTED TO TORTURE OR TO
CRUEL, INHUMAN OR DEGRADING TREATMENT OR PUN-

ISHMENT. —---Article 5

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT TO RECOGNITION EVERY=
WHERE AS A PERSON BEFORE THE LAW.
————— Article-6

NO ONE SHALL BE SUBJECTED TO ARBITRARY ARREST,
DETENTION OR EXILE. ----- Article-9

EVERYONE CHARGED WITH A PENAL OFFENCE HAS THE
KIGHT TO BE PRESUMED INNOCENE UNTIL PROVED
GUILTY ACCORDING TO LAW IN A PUBDIC TRIAL AT
WHICH HE HAS HAD ALL THE_GUARANTEES NECESSARY

FOR HIS DEFENCE.
————— Artiele 1141)

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT
TO FREEDOM OF OPINION AND EXPRESSION.
B Article 19

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT TO FREEDOM OF PEACEFULL,

ASSEMBLY AND ASSOCIATION -
------- Article - 2()

3
LEEE AT RICASIE R EEANIERIR VAR BT (GACR ISl

wifer spre «F [ AR 9 e A FIFES] o=
FIFTS co qeI Ea-adnT SR Tl Faeel Aerde [
[ReEice el frggl sireifEss TREliNE Toifde e firle Siges FfER
i IR | TR SIS Gl 18 FAICe! i B | 1| ereriae
emeTe e TmsieE @Al Soi ware Y @l ATREE bellf
S STl gremiied ol a7es HifE Flola's A T Sligd Tere
SRz B AICy s S T AR/ Sa T 9lfe T glee g ez
SS P 59 b TEEIN 2191 SPTe RS 9 (EreANEE qifeTs [e
S SIB-5 5 8 S SPT ST Sl2ea] WiEA sp8e | 48 7T U
B Wi ¥ AR G A e w=1 onfers Sifg<sla
(Fundantental Rights) i9i% St 4F S0z | A4 Fefe SiZd 124
ﬁ‘% f‘?im?ﬂ??f 915 kg (United Nations) FCIE A6 FYT 1
TR0% | 43 SIf% e AT 57 RAIE (2l Qg/ 2o/ Sleib] b oFas
At R ifEsis 2l S0 S0 1+t | e sriE 1w «ARfEfe
A (@ ST B ST T sl I SiEe R opi 91feTl s
Tecal S A @i Srepbia-Fien 41, 1l ARETe 2ol F4 4374
4wl 7 5ellE (N0 | AT 4O RS (J1Y NI @ ZITR
AR A el R ol AiE | e Oob IR i< Soes AiiHieic
I S A S2FI4 RS S2ATS ALE| T AT | SR I2 S MRS
T Gl IR I 91 SviEae] S0z | AT OB Tt FIe
wifge wjcz SN & Sff 4F €0z, oiEd g4 e AfFEe (e
4919 "\swﬁ/i@/ﬁﬁm wf3e eecm el (@i Ao wf@ A1, &
@I SI3A [avm 96 Ficafbe 20e ©FF (@Femea @14 S419 (6%l 51 1%
3l RS ity SRR A9 A, Ry 7 Bl /S I AT S 1
& & wizeere 7R Sitg S o AR Bere & & siftw
@Trﬂir T Fifer SRR St Torels F9e @ite a1 i,
w14 Fara AT d1Ee)/wE e ARG e 9% 2G| 0 AELS SERTE




4

Feafbe 29 4 g SifEn g Y51 T FAR 2 IS B 7 Tive
T2 AP, OIF FE (T SHEA T9E (F TS, ©i 23S Tray T |
(e ‘-

ST TN A S AT ALATI T WL
Hpod AT adfe

: e TS e TS TiEE eeieel Fire B WA SIfEslE
SIET SITe® 99 61 2Sid (AF1E #1al HifRe | SPTe W© O (el
oS FeAfRE | S v o B S SPES (T AT B HEAT TS |
- offF s Wil el 561 cemia 12 B, wfte «fowt mARIfET
SRS SRS S NG e e | e I e A |
ﬁ-mm?aﬁwwwaﬁwmﬁ@wmwmerwqﬁ |
2 | e RGN @2 oifS MRS St SIHRIE |
(5) T I FRoioma Fwoy /S, AeAfos Sl e
BT 1913 @oIe® GRITA! i/ St sieafbo 228 5! 2o
sz Reg, Fafifos wfea iz AR s/ el =R F5 | |
() ffftea/srorblas =oal (g o1/ AfSeIin W/Waﬁt
Feolda eI s s | ik
' (4) Siewfi o S @mwmﬁiﬂmﬁ’rﬁw
2P ST FIT Wmﬁwwwﬁ—maﬁ%ﬁﬂm
B O R o o I
(o) "WBIE wEm. ol ?ﬂt@ ww 'Z:Ib‘ﬁ' m \eﬁ i3
- A/ RFIFe 4 o menmﬁmel

(@ i <Al TSR TS S S (S0T TorE GRS |
VG HE @Wn—ﬁt?ﬁ oI (E® R FI(92 crﬁ\ﬁ:@ 2T |
99 FEE Sl @i

(2) SneffR Xt e/ = Wﬁ%ﬁ@ﬂiﬁmﬁ, Cors |

TEJe AP FIF) |

5

(RiwieTiEaee) Faifoe @iiamems e S sete bide @R
IR 9 | A GRS 51 B Tw4i3 fofew @iRre seifEeT
e o1 DfFesia s ofg Hag 51 | SR P e

(F) CICT! goig =hell HeEbe 20 g #ifFaierq s12 vaﬁ‘m I
(ST SR Bh(ta] @eiig)d R A #1oig frfifeels seita B
S O 2 FEIE 9 HEA |

(A) GFIGIGETIF 85S Bl IR FTe Srefibla 2 A-r>ifs 498
et Q@ e 929 46 (W EETS ) W St ey Affey wife
Gifoet ARfES wMere Aifirs A o [ifen wltape wfe-Rpfes
ST ST A=A Fevere! B a1, ©2U Feelz/ (299 F1, Sz
ISl BN Sl 18 TP 2SRy 99 2 SN SR B T
HiRce ! e ddeifes FivFes sEHs $F o sIFie
R Te /P Aere At FIN FS a2 (@S] Fenes w80y | e
&Jeol oTeal @2 e 5 SpRTe e Sl e (|l e Sl
GRAIF O/ BT FERSFITH 79 ialbe wifsa Aeg 9o ofeaw
JefStas TR0 SiF A cRae Wifews Sigasie HigRT TG @<
We'e 1 At e 73 o sffeiE vy a53 | (e Surd 991
TP (A WA S SIeE e iR e #29idae e 2 Hed
@2lfRe SEGH, HI<QIT SIS AT S Ag[ &7 | FFe Aiiore
IR TSRS 191 ST %9 A 1Y 4 |) e i & @i
stolSfEF ARG T/ FAeT BoARS S qieieea Fwee slersiiEm
FRITSTI AT/, eI, SifEret Siie W A e g
GIE (A \CHFE S| 5RNE TEEF Tifde Fle e S5 | wiienn] e
Give QAT s a0 s vl d" ebgs Sl vl aqie 7o
5 | :

(1) A IfF BT (51 Free Ty e i€ 28 Wie'y (@ ki FRler e
{ o] FReg R U @I Sl wlre FEnEe

B |



6

(=) G et/ et/ e T/ gt wieeree ey i 4 G
o AW G ig e bt/ AR 2P/ Ceregtan epeiore <1 il
G FRTE (e TGS /A Agq efef ey a5 Sl
ST ANEF |

(8) qrereTe e Tl LR AGTAPT ©20 ez’ G
IR S/ A S SR 2 SRR SRR e Sl
SeslwTal FRie O (2R (1 i fFed JAAaut ek S| G
mwwmmwﬁmwwmaﬁamww
T fFieitae SoTEe FIPhR cetaet R AT | (F3l < Sy R
A TS were @ F9F)

(s)mﬁmmmmmm(ﬁﬁ@mm)

2oz T Ol ©2I/ATS[TE RN F9F |

(S)Wwﬁﬂw@ﬂ?wwwwwmwﬁmﬁ@
CTE ColIpS ST SieTed i e Ste{ffl Rl SR Al 90T 4379
mﬁaﬁs@aﬁmmwﬁmﬁmmm@wm@
S| Fee Fete Fhifeeis @il Faik e el s e
SRelST e At CollBACH! ARBERl S AIRE FGE |

(¢) wieff af wfEet, s a3 cwae e el
STaf T e, SN/ S AT N T FACS AT
S e SR AN - -

R T e Mol ROIRR, e (FaS SILAIS evive

Rrg Wity @i AfRR-| Ssf e, e SieAE wify, TR
e Gecdl T/ R Woal AkAfbe 20 ol 264 GAISF F
s Sigd A (o =R FE |

v

Sifd Sell GORI 1<t

(5) So@l4 (OFFENGE) 8 SigT® i@ #fi aiell =

(3) TIA(SUMMONS) ¢ SIS Sios e Siises e
3fe 9 Feihal i SihF /3 wifdel s e i e g

(©) *@RE (WARRANT) 8 SIWielte (el If& SmieTes
Bt Faee SR fa e o |

(8) BEIBL#IEIa (SEARCH WARRANT) & il 78
il

(¢) %914 (COGNIZABLE OFFENCE) 8 f @oRi I3
o SEE R @S] AR @ERiE 9em BEE SIivs SR
ol(q | T e TPl FEd foeTe (are gel, 434, ThiEl 2eiifi|

(%) G S#F1K (BAILABLE OFFENCE) & 4t SIPd14e
SPRIAE GifiFe I& @RIG TiFe SlEsH|

(2) @il =g J151 (NON COGNIZABLE OFFENCE) $
T SRS SRR SIS SR S g TR Al | Tee
ol | B e SRA SriaaT oy I SA9EN erTs |

(v) G (BAIL) & Simteics [ =i« FfiE #fsias a9
@i1f5e RATCS CollvR WA GRS SPRIgE (FICT . T
e & SR fa, {1 smErs Real Sifde Srads smmres e
1 g sieet | SFell e (ol S a1 AfeE o €3e anee

O FE



T ¢ e SITANE AN

T e
(491 - 85 CFEMIR] WidA)

s, T Oom TE vFey SeFige Give A IW (S @IE e
e (qegE), ©2) 9l Iespre e @ GeTt sFed S7[lY
AEe FEEl

2. A I SZAACS SR T o1 =

o, I @I GRR SRS F5ie ACEF |

8, wﬁwﬁamammml

¢. SRR R ol s 9 A o3 4 |

v, IE I ARTE 211 Aotz FECeT |

q. Clgee (L mmwmaﬁﬁww mﬁwwﬁm
ICCERCEIDION

v, S2FYE 9@ =i colel SR 45 SEre SMECS  qERS B4
el oot SRE at Siviered & e S Sy S |

> W A% @t mrwwwww%f@ AP |
((ﬁl@ﬂ%@ﬁﬂaw- 5@3)

0. FERES ST T (CFGUINl IR 30 &W)

3. I SPNRE ERI R s STl s F<[ Poe
e #IRoE ool <54t 91 S OB Sl (GRemISl Sigas 4| 82)

S 3, SN GG SR Raais =i @ilol SreRigs ied [oif 2t |

Qs g2 AR T [osa sl Sifgs S we=] g T
- qifETe f @IE 9TW e (@@ s elde s o cddE
i SifEels i | s s AfETIE 28 95 foeae epas S«
e it 99 Ui sfews wg el 71 sl S SiTFias 28

9

1Bl oge Afeems TES welfE ebse e FRI &l | aw
R sl B wEeme Habeas Corpus 3 1 e/ i
@ ST Al | g

@I AT $RI A ¢

S| B i S Rl (GRemIS | Siigae 85, 8% Hiah)

3| 7 i wieR T de Wiy weEly kebe =, Rl
ST TR TSl SIgAT 89 Hiat)

o | ft wOlTHE ST, G SRty SRS =, (ors welEie
(Fremis] Sies 4i9t 88)

g B @l Gl @ SivleTed A el S R

Reme e AT RoR el SiE S oE SR
T R 35 [ Sive wfvs 4 37 A 9 SL4l St

o (e e it R A afte SR el i feve

Gl qiENE e o fofes Al wim @E olivee SiRREE
@ ofes @gE S|

el cFae St SifEwis ¢

S| SRR (AN 9 EIFSEE S8Ry AEE Y F[E A
RS EReE SifEs ¥ el $[a @i |

S | SIMETes (IR AR @RI @dE F9 @FF @l
FlEa iR i &) (cigemites a@ FiRd ifke wAe il
qlKroeTs S (20 ) '

o | I SMiEe @ @l @iEEiE el sihEEEy

IUE ISR T i B i B S | PR e (< B R 1 0 I (R (L
el /4EE SEAe @9E a0z (EFEMIE] S 2T gIEl @o)

8| fie  Awwa @I SiEwEia #90e Slilvdl I DG
(CFIEmIS] Sigag 2 % «&h) :
¢ | ST @ B P9 SivleTels SIS T 2Arer (2«



10

S AW 7 18 96 [UeTs eree @IE! TR e Qe F
#R | GRRYNT 23 49 Si% GRemISl SIged ¢aar 4190

[ 3l A =T IR AR S|

a | e it v A SR Biecoree agal@ 43 <19
s corw, BFeorwe G o BFer 29 =i Sl S
Raaier fey qow Sol-offmds T3 AR | (CRETNTS R 1
fes BT 2gald ATH FERIG! ACORERF (0=

v EeR 9 AT @< NEEl B aRie A $fR7
AfF | (WIS Si2qs @ a2 4

5 | MOIFRR TS RN FERE TR AGE 46t Hivorss
il A AT SERS @ S SR A (GRS S 8
. 4= ‘

So | TRFENT SRS @dR TE SifF (RN SiESE|
| iR IRE et EUR TES TmEee ST
@ AT SR A | A 2 NIRRT SiRs SiEns S e A |

S3 | SIMETST @GR AFERAE SFTS (AT TEER AR
cotii SIfEgs |

o GE olisgs Y s8 T S SIew frare §ewee/ |

S |

S8 | SRR Rl 1 i e 26 TR G o ne e
e 2 39N SRR (eI Mg S dR0)

(@) SR Rl 1 TS e SRS A6 swEe Sy
2wy S FCAIF ColT SIEE |

() T TG TS SIS =fF 150 S SEEIR
o0 A5 “TEe e Awwd SIS el SEEE | |

o STAAlE (@aFid 9l AE -

cafegt SRl (@2E 9 EiF age 2l [ 15 IR s
o e AR STeRAl A o T AR Fge ST
Eel7l TEET SR A

11

(&) SIfNFES EIRR SPRIES RN 20 :

(4) e T BT ST AFET, THRA, IE STHIE !
3 ot epfex 2= -

(s1) =R SR fBrT AR 2T TS TSI 4, SRRyl F419
TSI A9 S S S 2oF 29l SalT FT AR AT = |

el Tl R, IW -

(F) FRE-SoE [TeTs AT -

(%) SIS AT SR SIHETs REFA (A T =T
e |

(o)) Rl 3! Al EIFAST FAPT 20 -
Y, @EE AR @ RS (ARFS ACF -

() SISARSE SIPRIHT =0T - |

(5) I I T 20 -

(=) feeT 20 -

(%) feei= 2o 1 SEe oFied 723 -

IS QT @A 8-

(>) celelE Tt ST Rt (@A Qe SieiEt 2
() Temt 24y =/7ifRres et s <1t srgestl w1nifees vl sl & ot
Wl e 2Ifem FeaEl 23 |
(o) &=l (et Siwiers, afv fEm/seg i neidled Jes
SrifSeE Sl Wb FE |
(8) ©ub =raieTs, =l (sl cmme AnRiFIc < [ Sieava T 0 |
(@) Tobes djiwlerd, A Cob wiRIEEE el S A FCF |

Rz @ o Tfowty eheriga col<l TIEl SiE0e (e[l R



12

CRPETT  @ite ST St SR sl | AgR Fatest sigd
G (G 2@ ral teel

@it @i et T AE-

(5) Gifsi=eel SRy 206, @I AR GIERRIE @ 26T
T SRl Faal wat weldied = 2l |

() G e 2RRTS ‘G’ tF @I ST EIRRIes
Bt 21tet @R 1 A (CREmIST 2T 8wy 41)

() 1 TR @A A S FeEiee el 1 I s
Fom e

(8) GRFCEIY S 20 S e Rers Aiae @dF (oo fF
e 1 fooge) aE FOAND) MeIFH Sedl ST SEFEFY evte e
Fraice Sifiie Tel Y W 21w | (GFremiS) oigas & v &S

(@) S IsT ATl CAllbss 2R Al @ifS et fEeidag
ifEas Colelia et Caleli Gl TRl sl wUifares e e STl (ol T
i fwa AT

13

(50) GIffF @5 Si7aET oo FARF] g T vo e foess
(6T T T2 G (AARITH! SRR (GFTemIS) Sige s 4[4) |

(55) FEMS (FAE PI5S ToYe Hiael AT oI ei#iet [eapaige
2 2ifEee SRRE wiee SEme NS Sl e FifE 2w |

SRl e e SR 91w ¢ -
5 SR RS S AR WO SR 3 e, (e Siged
R FRIFATE S SR | SI5F 791 TES ST suslbe
Qe SRR s, RedEes wfeen i B =T Rls Sf[ 9 el
AR A METE R @ Ien s Fffen sizTs s | 3eeds TeiEfe
ﬁr?ﬁf?_fh BAR ™ : -
S | SIIFR] Geld A1 Sl 59 AT - |
21 99 T SIFR Graies AGE 46t Bireries agats we
Pl R TR TN FNSTF |
e | 19t e Mg wieiEE 2IfET FER vl erTs

() ST Ca1oly ST TRCe S CoANICD! SR RS O o oot et <ol il < i SiBiEcE R o i
) SR : ek
2 A welFied el AEded e el S veIE Al SERT era ety w9 | mel o] T ARIE 91 eeARe 5 R o

Gifis fra 2l |

(2) Jgve, ALHRA TS T w9l (o= Al @R F »o
i e 1% (o169 ©ve 32}l 72, (ot S o fims o @i C-Ac!
G e SfETE (EFemIS] Sigasova 4l

(v) S ColbaS (R (Ea o i fBese @iivs wre eyl
e el Rl AT G CARIT SIS (GREmiS] SR sva
giEl) |

(5)© T THS I SO RS T 0T vl SART F{
Bzl SR GI8 SIIETCS G [ 2 S & Sl 9IE FEms
18 ey 1 S o o 1 e e wiiEs =iz |
(AT SET ovs 4i)

=

& | Fres/Srerbie brelal eia e [iecm (ollvs Saia sifd<sie Siice |

@ | SIS el oo 20e ST S elal, 52xg] Sl
e sifers Niag Sifgss st e sfecte eRed 59|

v | Ifn SievE e wiga e e wanes sigiesiie (e
oot BRI &1eel a7l ©ob = Govwsl e ebew fFids wiferbl

- wifde HET A |

b | ISR AR Geda wwae] 9z s> e 5g SFES (T8 ShE
T4l flve Ffites SR, siasticy nelfR evas aifem @Rl Frse
wrefibiea [en [a3e & srenviaa a2 TRive SR biveiss awy Fa9
A SFANY T |




14

A Fareet =iz (NSA) at =i efecainE
QT BB 6T 2 e FEF T ] IPTIPTR

S | SOl TG FeorEa o9l Sitd 9t Fomi afefes sive
4| e weal sical 7 o |

3 | FfFS wigaee FaRe S e foote b 19 sifsct
sz (Grounds of Detention) &=iq =ilf7id-|

o | Sferalel e Fge 9 9l A AR RS e [Tete
e SaFIE S129] it Ao fan wgersie sicms (Representation)
o191 wcal, R4 pepled Reapel < | |

8 |wiiza4 e R fran shiwe foeTe wifts <1 e e
ST 497 91 92 TAME! @€ (Advisory Bom*d)?a’ﬂ%?ﬁf@ﬁl
(TSl ALTORER | TAWMB! I06 S0 9 MG e e B 6]
w3 Siite 361 U e 2ol wE, 360 SsEite Fe el
SAIE ST A S T AR Fed T e et i a4

| G S5 6 BIFIRT Tl S &1 FfR il St
9 FEATE b T P, SfeTatel Al S T, ST st
oifRatel celeel SR w0 | SYAR Ay S SIS S-S
o il kA R ofd e HIISeeT (e SRR e |

q |9 1l ST [R5 9 (s el (S8 FRRrel<s 267 2e1e
55 @4l @I S S 2Al7 |

> | S5 B9 FASTHIHIT R SHLNTA wgrere Tare I A/
yo| ISR SIS e v, sfis, SieeR s
SpRele & T e K| SiafE sifewls) e o6l s el

T gfe eferld grere TR & CARIE! SfEsia |

15

Sy | S5 <91 Feorwe f{ TR AR esTe T%ﬁf?aﬁwﬁaim
wiq 2SR AR T SIEF | - :

mwwmummml .

s | fie SIGR<E, Al SRISE @97S @M 96 Bl Q4
RTINS FE SR Sl FEAT TgaiE 2nfie F9iE WivF

s | ST A1 S SR ST {2 (ARIS o1 a1cel ATHIBIE
el fem Sifdelts e 55 |

o | Rl Gy BT SR T S s w2, o FiE
R AR o AR SIfE |

8 | 0] SEe fed SERels woe STl ST SfHs ik |

el SNEANS T

Y| SR 22V TR LIS SIFTS el O AR Sl
SRR 93 72 YIS SRTS T [HERrs YT A s (Writ
of Habeas Corpus) %= #lt |




16

Afes HAfffee R 27 A4 Fone
A @It 4999 FeT 91 oS TR Sl
o SR Ryl
e R SRR A R S ¢ s o

@I G APiejE FRffer Jt el FEe SEb] ek AW I
AT ez weIfE TS o1 ael | [ e Sehre e 2

ot Pz 1T R el B S5ed § I6T6 il TN STy 31 -

T A wOlFR o SN AETEiE [ @I ACrRET 2o
SIS 5 A | bl el ol SR Bt @ Sieibia
TS N, SITER Sl TN aEqul Seifge Ak = e |

sl SIFADT SR CRae wiAerE [{od Fomsel @il
AfEe SR S e Siet] el 2t | Gl iR st
STReT ©lE5] 91 4l e BiSeitet Fa siedl Gilatelle S e @2 |
AT cETEETe SfEE ST SREl veidE SR treierd L 1 ol
AT SEANET AR ST TS T $T6T S
/STy S, mﬂwwﬁmmwwwwaﬁwwﬁ—

s Fffaits @ TE, oo -

(5) (S SO FEF AT 2 CHE Gr SR bh1© (#fdo
woifE /caliva frm, “af sieehl fcer oo SRl Collbs sT=sT SRl
3@, (o0 Gl 327 WiFS niEHd evge ofes SIF GllalRd a9
MR, AR @ TAT)

(3) SIFIB TS S SISIIEAS, (HIE! (< SIS 2, BT
v BiEFeslee Biee S{ aNdeiq 3ReE T SIS TS HICATT
C9lloS TS F9F |

BAEEE B @ gace Faisiel Aifent- G-I Srefibia
=fRce el Al (BResl (35=) s1da | (@Al 10AIHE, SF%Em I

!

17

Aeifde, SiEd e 4Rt 24 WWWW ﬂmml BEIA
STl SRz T A | R S0 Woa] oA S /7S 2iad
Ao W [fFveelE ke FE |

e /cvmon@am o/ Sits S99 Pres a2 —

el AT SRS A & ! @ (i o
3 RCIEYSRAIGTE o110 GYe) TIFS SILS FE 251 28 EGACRICICE O
Foae ) SITRIE sae M aicel | SITRIG N 391 9l CFIS #AS1
WW@WWWQS‘HWW@W G| IR
7Ol Soe, 2 fEF FCERIE! ALORLETE (5) O = TSR SieE
WWWWW@T% 4l agF) Tw MRS Coliv]
S (e | GlES TS S SaeRE a3 T S SIgRET Aatsics
I R (IR T @i & colloae, sl sNEFs, T4 @i SIFHIE
YRR SR, O FiReSE Wit €6 EFSET SRRl G@li] e |
AT ST I | forfae el S RaaE greRe ofa [,
o0 SEsh] B o oA mate] 9 < |

(©) SR e Fl GlcTl Srepivi i welfe evae [al
 oiE T T A SFEEH FGEF | G TS A6 Al SRESR
w5E @4 Gfeee SIF SibE e R i Sl [FEae RK)ee
CRJETe SR %7 |

SRSl wigd SiE 7 AR [edE el B svav (el
iEEE GHl AT =it T Eas (@@ FaE SEEE a2 @

FifEnE @@ AR EFl 2eAlte FE e o (8) (ST
JfIFBfeS el o= i Tigi=aa FF blAF | a9 s e S0

AJE(R STIEIERERE GG | Rl Siizeies Gl qifemican Fead v cadis

i 4l S G FATS Wfed GHAICE | 93 s B fIAEEd =AY

Aot stz (¢) oo #fEMERs 2 FeEss SR bIFRE | :
(v) @I G G Al @l SraoNRs AfETIc @it w4l 28



18

T4 5Tl SRR SIEE, Pl SECll 2AF e TH5 RIERIE F
S1oles | (ST B AR (2 (@Al Al gdl AT gepl e femIcel
SEtee| i@ g Tw meme derEmed S (habeas
corpus) wif¥s] = (1) SR a7 Sl SIBRA R e AAfrieael
RCIG F0, ST ©2l @G (@i Sios 99 Pve I e
1A Callo SR RO, (Ore SHEP A1E! #16 | Gt ST FTHIEICe
R I Wie] T4 S FEICS @GS (YR [S0F FETS
el AR 4l (o6F TG I I 2Nl 279 o Faw e ewy )
ol | Rl el SitE SR, @IE e At efife, i Fea
SI@ 228 SR #9196 (livTs ArFIR w7l e EIwF Gl IEEl
& @Il qaeT oIy SufexE e, sl ool 7S TS Sl |

A I ICEAR TACRIICT

Gl SRR T NEets *leniel 2ol a1 WOl 4%, Yes
Sy | e W ey Srepblee el F9E Al | el AfSE,
Srefla | G SFEeld @ Sl @ A9 a3 ¥oal @Y k9T A
ey Wiz SeEiG SfEd @R | e =l A Fif? 2T Afewiy
= IR | T dfermy FRA sl d TS Srie X ARl
aﬁaﬁtaﬁm@mﬁ@wwwwwmsmﬁﬁmm
CI G- ST QETHSI (Tiee aidl GGl e gl izeis
Frffon /oI TR Dol IRADS T ARSI, b SIS
Fifare s wiks =R 4fiel/ Fifies! sEE eI A< el
4 ol | AR et e A St e 19l e Wl /Agetel
R ATl SRETE FEE | oA, (FICL AR AifEe WS
Rl T evae TR A @E gl S ) Sl | el ~fiae
Csli5q CarEEEE Silalfe wie AEEce Bsh ATRERE ebd sifora i |
g 212N S 24l ] TarE TREE S| bR qoeiE fefere sifere
iR < CreRioErE/ BT aeel @bl | SIEFE (olbs AGITT

13

w3 SR SR (E FU T Ffa s<aieTs fEma g4y s
weldeE evae (olpd <fFd el Al HET T Tob e e5q bifeN
ol7< | HefeE Calipee e Tre| AT eoASe (SIbAhl 92 offasricel
fi6q T4, G (@IGIerae ST 28 9D foote CreS] 2
WHEWWWWWWW%QWE@
ST Sl B Tzl Fa Al | TR e s 2=l S7Ee
o, o Al SiEE /AT fFReerd Al baesss
gl e | (Rl BArg S9N v @ QT | STF B 2]
iz Sl i @S /@GR SiE aEEEe S Fa Al
oI (G s, R S AR To sfver fefesr e
CIEEGI[b)

| hm gt ke [Rrme gon /Adte

Toil [ga-Aay

P IR RO Tl S Snay ANE Pl ST Afne
(g s Falerel qiETe Arves e s & @I 98H @R 2]
g ] AVl TRE, (% Wl [4g T 9% | RS RS (FRAble
e i ©Re bAE Gl Al B R A wie F e
FRIE, @R s Tife /fore wife =% (ZHese S 4
taw) B Wt FeE 9T (@iaE U Fa 2Rl veEre 29)l ]
wif3 WCE RN | G (St el #ikef5 T £ (allb<a JISRTS RIS
@54 BIPE w1l | SYAR @ a9 G @l SRS o[l SivE S
@ e /e 1 Fee gen @3 weed e Al 0 S8 RaS
fifere Si7a =TRERE €5a Bif2la w1 =T mEaT W6 FE w6l Sl SR
(2% |



20

(5) Gl e (Al I SIS (Rl AT s1or® Aol
woelg Read vicely SR #Ieat |
(3) @I EeR /oios wRfe, e FREe, @ S
tolfee, @ coliEe ARdE SR, T8 R TP wifEfee, e
g coifee, e wfeems 2ol Jeiie aaiT aifEEe siw & i
EiE B Fede 2o/ wive wRe 29 FEeEE o2 AR
Sicst | S U (alpTe R SR ,
(o) 7o /gl RIS g PAbS SRR SRS AT (Post
mottem) FIE o ST fere e [t (Inquest report)
45| TSR FE @ TSIFHE ST | 18 [Ribe Jormes AT [e99

@ 5ie F FeAl mwm@%@%ﬁﬁwmw@éﬁﬁ -

Wﬁwwﬁﬁmﬁﬁﬁf?ﬁ‘ﬂﬁ@ﬂ@ﬁ@m%?ﬁﬂ@
i, Al 2|l mre & [ e (efem i, 6| wial, SSIIHIEE, D)
siite FRER FEEs T e [ebe ¢lvTs 9F TR g wllE
I A 2 ARTER (I GRO FgeTelid (oHIN T8, 8% fi
il | Saceite ~ 9 ety Pz T FR TSR SIg T3]
Qi el SN 2T went teal e ANl Gl ol Sler|

(8) fl el zont /gl kA oA 2l IRED ST bF I O
GD Entry @@ @& UDeabs Agigs 24| a2 T Ael [
I 5 S Fas G Colloa A, AN e (PRIFES GfRAce
SRR, Seeed AR AfeeEm i | @8 Fppz A e FE
o ARFIER/ AT G EIE CGIBCH! SR ©ie | Sl . (IS
clivg ©fE9d Al - ’

(¢) o Al RTBIAAE-LAT|-Fa-= 2 8 AHF
' | 3t S SiMsoe RS ot Rl oierE SEE Al |

- AfY wRalE R A
R oo/ SreJipled Fere Q)
o) 31 FnE B @i Sifes SivE F4E BIpe (7l SNSRI

21
Tepl {4 i@ Si2d SioE I EIE EIRE CY (DS T3NS

| Sreisi SR IR | AT i RGP WO CRA® o7 <ol g IR

) &) @WWW%WWWWW
i 7ol R el PG RTICBT TRee kel $ Fawees
AT el 2l Sl TS Collbe w1 e 7%« (FIR, Inquest
Report etcwie? $ ¥@l 7ea Tieg TS C7los ©f¥7 st |

(ﬂ)[:-wmm%@wwm@mmw,
SeIIbR B B, G AT A e Been $[e SE3
o Wil #fa, #FS1 e I Bieery e ofq ST ke
4R colpe SfREEIEe! | SebRE TwTe PIve Tg Il <o oIS wwgeyl
SR 1 Frfffoe Ufeer YFeTolE SITS, (S0F B AR
© S A A T TR GleRe R e 2R fEfam
ﬁ@am|mﬂa@ﬁm’/f@i@aﬁﬁﬁaﬁﬁamﬁwﬁﬁﬁ@—w
SB[ SR IR I | A CRPRES B et 8o
w5 el S FE | o1 B dfemve Tite Ags &1, ©F @

| Siggle 29 el | O TfET cRae cofiee [F by RS ceteiE/
. 5s o9l ace, iz [Ecwe Sl i Sl |

(1) feraits Tol 91 (Tl SREeited 2SR A (/SN
@Il oltvsd AR, inquest report, SR AfSETAT T I
Hrelg, (|9 = IeEt |

G e s AN vees Sl Tiees & s
ol SREe (of Bl wall SiiE ARy (2RI Ol ARG s
ardl <4 A1 (96 SiETIs SR | G SRR 27 ST



22

ANNEXURE - |

THE ASSAM DISTURBED AREAS ACT, 1955*
(Assam Act XIX of 1955)!
(Passed by the Assembly)

{Recerved the assent of the Governor of Assam on the 14th
December, 1955}

An Act to make better provision for the suppres'sion of disorder
and for the restoration and maintenance of public order in disturbed
areas in Assam.

Preamble. Whereas it is necessary to make better provision fors
the suppression of disorder and for the restoration and maintenance 0f .

public order, in the disturbed areas in Assam.

It is hereby enacted in the Sixth Year of the Republic¢ of India as
follows.

1. Short title, extent and commencement. (1) This Act may be
called the Assam Disturbed Areas Act, 1955.
(2) It extends to the whole of Assam subject to the provisions of
S.3 below.
(3) It shall come into force at once.

2. Definition. In this Act "disturbed area" means an area which

is for the time declared by notification undes S¢3 (o be disturbed area.

3. Power to declare areas to be disturbed area. The Stale

Government may, by notification in the official Gazeltte, declare that
the whole or any part of any district of Assam as may be specified in
the notilication is a disturbed area.

23

4. Power to fire upen person contravening orders. Any
Magistrate or Police Officer not below the rank of a sub-Inspector or
Havildar in case of the Armed Branch of the Police or any officer of
the Assam Rifles not below the rank of Havildar , may, if in his
opinion, it is necessary-so to-do for the maintenance of public order,
after giving such warning, if any, as he may consider necessary, fire
upon, or otherwisc use force even to the causing of death, against any
person who is-acting in force even to the causing of death, against any
person who is acting in contravention of any law or order for the time
being in force in a disturbed area, prohibiting the assembly of five or
more persons or the carrying of weapons or things capable of being
used as weapons or firearms, ammunition and explosive substances.

5. Power to destroy arms, fortified positions, etc. Any
Magistrate or Police officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector or
any officer.of the Assam Rifles not below the rank of Jamadar may, if
in his opinion, it is necessary S0 {0 do destroy any arms, dump prepared,
ot fortified positions or shelters from which armed attacks are made
orattempted, structures used gangs or absconders wanted for offences
in connection with the disturbances.

6. Protection of persons acting under Ss. 4 and 5. No suit,
prosecution or other legal proceeding shall be instituted except with
the previous sanction of the State Government against any person in
respect of anything done or purporting to be done in exercise of the
power conferred by Ss. 4 and 5.

7. Repeal of Ordinance V of 1955 (1) The Assam Disturbed
Areas Ordinance, 1955 (V of 1955), is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal any notification issued, anything
done or any action taken in exercise of the powers conferred by or
under then said Ordinance shall be deemed to have done or taken in
the exercise of the powers conferred by or under this Act, as if this
Act were in force on the day on which such notification was issued,
such thing was done or action was taken.

= ] 0 T



24

ANNEXURE - II

THE ARMED FORCES (ASSAM AND MANIPUR)
SPECIAL POWERS ACT, 1958
(Act 28 of 1958)
(11th September, 1958)
An Act enable certain special powers .to be conferred upon
members of the armed forces in disturbed areas in the

State of Assam and the Union Territory of Manipur.

Be it enacted by Parliament in the ninth year of the Republic of
India as follows :

1. Short title and extent. (1) This Act may be called the Armed
Forces (Assam and Manipur) Special Powers Act, 1958.

(2) Definitions. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires-

(a) "armed forces" means the Military forces and the air forces
operating as land forces, and includes any other armed forces of the
Union so operating;

(b) "disturbed area" means an area which is for the time being
declared by Forces Act, 1950, or the Army Act, 1950 shall have the
meanings respectively assigned to them in those Acts.

3. Power to declare areas to be disturbed areas. If the
Governor of Assam or the Chief Commissioner of Manipur is of the
opinion that the whole or any part of the State of Assam or the Union
Territory of Manipur, as the case may be, iS in such.a distuibed or
dangerous condition that the use of armed forces in. aid of'the civil
power is necessary, he may, by Notification in the official Gazette,
declare the whole or any partt of the State or Union Territory to be a
disturbed area.

4. Special powers of the armed forces. Any commissioned
officer, warrant officer, noncommissioned offieer or any other person
of equivalent rank in the armed forces may, in a disturbed area-

(a) If he is opinion that it is necessary so to do for the maintenance
of public order, after giving such due warning as he may consider
necessary, fire upon or otherwise use force, even to the causing of
death against any person who is acting in contravention of any law or

25

order forthe time being in forces in the disturbed area prohibiting the
assembly of five or more persons or the carrying on of weapon or of
things capable of being used as weapons or of firearms, ammunition
or explosive substances;

(b) If he is of opinien.that it is necessary SO to do, destroy any
arms dump, preparedeor fortified, position or shelter from which armed
attacks are made ot are likely to be made or are attempted to be made,
orany structureused asa training camp for armed volunteers or utilized
as a hide-out by armed gangs or absconders wanted for any offence;

(c) Arrest, without watrant, any person/who has committed a
COgnizabIe offence/or against whom a reasonable suspicion exists that
he‘ﬂfi;gg‘rponimsitted/ or is/about to commit/a cognizable offence and may
uSe such force as.may be necessary to effect the arrest,

s (d) Enter and search without warrant, any premise_:s to make
any such arrest as aforesaid or to recover any person believed to be
wrongfully restrained or confined or any property reasonably suspected
tobe stolen property or any arms, ammunition or explosive substances

be’ﬁ;qy.ecl to be unlawfully kept in such premises and for that purpose
use such as may be necessary.

5. Arrested persons to be made over to the police. Any person
arrested and taken into custody under this Act shall be made over to
the officer-in-charge of the nearest police station with the least possible
delay, together with a report of the circumstance occasioning the arrest.

6. Protection to persons acting under this Act. No prosecution
suit or other legal proceeding shall be instituted, except with the
previous sanction of the Central Government, against person in respect
of anything done or purported to done in exercise of the powers
conferred by this Act.

7. Repeal and savings. (1) The Armed Forces (Assam and
Manipur) Special Powers Ordinance, 1958, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or
(aken under this Act. as if Act had commenced on the 22nd day of
May. 1958. 13 O 0 O |



26
ANNEXURE - III

THE NATIONAL SECURITY ACT, 1980
(65 OF 1980)
[27th December, 1980]

An Act to provide for preventive detention in certain cases and
for matters connected therewith.

Be it enacted by Parliament in the thirty-first year of the Republic
of India as follows :-

1. Short title and Extent- (/) This Act, may be called the
National Security Act, 1980.

(2) It extends to the whole of India except the State of Jammu
and Kashmir.

(2) Definitions- (/) In this Act, unless the contex! otherwise
requires,-

(a) "appropriate Government" means, as respects a detention
order made by the Central Government or a person detainéd under
such order, the Central Government and as respect a deteéhtion order
made by a state Government or by an officer subordinate to a State
Government or as respects a person detained undet such order, the
State Government;

(b) "detention order" means an order made under Section 3;

(c) "foreigner" has the same meaning as the Foreigners Act,
1946 (31 of 1946);

(d) "person" includes a foreigner,

- (e) "State Government", in relation to a Union térritory, means
the administrator thereof.

3. Power to make orders detaining certain persons-

(1) The Central Government or the State Government( may,-

(a) if satisfied with respect to any person that with a view (o
preventing him from acting in any manner prejudicial to the defence
of India, the relations of India with foreign powers, or the security of
India, or

|

2

(b) if satisfied with respect to any foreigner that with a view to
regulating his continued presence in India or with a view to making
arrangements for his expulsion from India, it is necessary so to do,
make an order directing that such person be detained.

(2) The Central’Government or the State Government may, if
satisfied with respect to any person that with a view to preventing him
from acting in any manner prejudicial to the security of the State or
from acting in-any manner prejudicial to the maintenance of supplies
and serviges essential to the eommunity it is necessary so to do, make
an order directing that such person be detained.

Explanation-For the purposes of this Sub-section, " acting in
any manner prejudicial to the maintenance supplies and services
gssential to the community "does not include" acting in any manner
prejudicial to the maintenance of supplies of commodities essential to
the community" as defined in the Explanation io Sub-section 3 of the
Prevengion of Black marketing and Maintenance of Supplies of
Essential Commodities Act, 1980 (7 of 1980), and accordingly, no
order of detention shall be made under this Act, on any ground on
which an order of detention may be made under that Act.

(3) I, having regard to the circumstances prevailing or likely to
prevail in any area within the local limits of the jurisdiction of a District
Magistrate or Commissioner of Police may also, if satisfied as provided
in Sub-section (2), exercise the powers conferred by the said
Subsection:

Provided that the period specified in an order made by the State
Government under this Sub-section shall not, in the first instance,
exceed three months, but the State Government may, if satisfied as
aforesaid that it is necessary so to do, amend such order to extend
such period from time to time by any period not exceeding months at
any one time,

(4) When any order is made under this Section by an officer
mentioned in Sub-section (3), he shall forthwith report the fact to the
State Government to which he is subordinate together with the grounds
on which the order has been made and such other particulars as, in his



28

opinion, have a bearing on the matter, and no such order shall remain
in force for more than twelve days after the making thereof unless, in
the meantime, it has been approved by the State Government:

Provided that where under Section 8 the grounds of detention
are communicated by the officer making the order after five days but
not later than ten days from the date of detention, this Sub-section
shall apply subject to the modification, that, for the words "twelve
days", the words "fifteen days" shall be substituted.

(5) When any orderis made or approved by the State Government
under this Section, the State Government shall, within seven days,
report the fact to the central Government together with the grounds
on which the order has been made and such other particulars as, in the
opinion of the State Government, have a bearing on the necessity for
the order.

4. Execution of detention order-A detention order may be
executed at any place in India in the manner provided for the execution
of warrants of arrest under the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2
of 1974).

5. Power to regulate place and conditions of detention-Every
person in respect of whom a detention order has been made shall be
liable-

(a) to be detained in such place and under'such conditions,
including conditions as to maintenance, dis¢ipline and punishment
for breaches of discipline, as the appropriate Government:may, by
general or special order specify, and :

(b) to be removed from one place of detention to another place
of detention, whether within the same State ot in another State, by
otder of the appropriate Government; -

Provided that no order shall be made by a State Government

under clause (b) for the removal of a person from one State to another

State except with the consent of the Government of that other State.

6. Detention orders not to be invalid or in-operative on
certain grounds-No detention or order shall be invalid or in-operative
merely by reason-

29

.. (a)that thelpetsontobe detained thereunder is outside the limits,,
of the territorial jurisdiction of the (Government or officer making the
order, or 4 1o} B ut
_(b) that the place of detention of suchiperson is outside the said
limits.: - & Hare 1 v ot doidw

7. Powers infelation to:absconding pexrson- (1) If the Central
Government or af officer mentioned in Sub-section (3) of Sejceti,onlia",
as the case may be, has reason to believe.that a personiin respect of
whom a deténtion ordenhas been made hasabsconded oris concealing
himself 0 that the order eannot be executed, that Government or
officermay- | vif Py

_I (a) make a report in writing of the fact to a Metropolitan Magistrate
or a Judicial Magistrate of the First Class having jurisdiction in the
placeswhere the said person ordinarily resides;

~ (b) by order notified in the Officer Gazette diregf the said person
to appear before such officer, at such place and within such period as
may be specified in the order.

" (2) Upon the making of a report against any person under clause
(a)'of Sub-section (1), the provisions of Sections 82, 83, 84 and 85 of
the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974), shall apply in
respect of such person and his property as if the detention order made
against him were a warrant issued by the:Magistrate.

(3) If any person fails to comply-with an order issued under
clause (b) of Sub-section (1) he shall, undess he proves that it was not
possible for him to comply therewith and that he had, within the period

- !

o

e Dab

Fais { it

- specified in the order, informed the officer mentioned in the order of

tl}e reason which rendered compliance therewith impossible and of
his whereabouts, be punishable with imprisonment for term which

- may.extend to one year, or with fine, or with both.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code Criminal

- Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974), every offence under Sub-section (3)

shall be cognizable.

8. Grounds of order of detention to be disclosed to persons
affected by the order- (/) When a person is detained in pursuance of



30

a detention order, the authority making the order shall, as soon as may
be, but ordinarily not later than five days and in exceptional
circumstances and for reasons to be recorded in writing, not later than
ten days from the date of detention, communicate to him the grounds
on which the order has been made and shall afford him the earliest
opportunity of making a representation against the order to the
appropriate Government.

(2) Nothing in Sub-section (1) shall require the authority to
disclose fact which it considers to be against the public interest to
disclose.

9. Constitution of Advisory Boards- (1) The Central
Government and each State Government shall, whenever necessary,
constitute one or more Advisory Boards for the purposes of this Act.

(2) Every such Board shall consist of three persons who are, or
have been, or are qualified to be appointed, as Judges of a High
Court, and such persons shall be appointed by the appropriate
Government. ‘

(3) The appropriate Government shall appoint one of the
members of the Advisory Board who is, or has been, a‘Judge of a
High Court to be its Chairman, and in the case of a Union territory
the appointment to the Advisory Board of any person who is aJudge
of the High Court of a State shall be with the previous approval of the
State Government concerned. i

10. Reference to Advisory Board - Save as otherwise expressly
provided in this Act, in every case where'a'detention order ‘has been
made under this Act, the appropriate Government shallyWithin three
weeks from the date of detention of a person under the order, place
before the Advisory Board constituted by it under Section 9, the
grounds on which the order has been made and order, and in case
wherte the order has been made and the representation, if any made by
the person affected by the order, and in case where the order has been
made by an officer mentioned in Sub-section (3) of Section 3, also the
report by such officer under Sub-section (4) of that Section.

11. Procedure of Advisory Board- (/) The Advisory Board

31

shall, after considering the materials placed before it and, after calling
for such further information as it may deem necessary from the
appropriate Government or from any person called for the purpose
through the appropriate Government or from the person concerned,
and if, in any particular casc, it considers it essential so to do if the
person concerned desifes to beé heard, after hearing him in person,
submit its report tofthe appropriate Government within seven weeks
from the date ofidetention of the person concerned.

(2) Thereport of the Advisory Board shall specify in a separate
part thereof opinion of the Advisory Board as to whether or not there
is sufficient.cause for the detention of the person concerned.

(3) When there is'a difference of opinion among the members
forming the Advisory Board, the opinion of the majority of such
membersshall be deemed tG'be the opinion of the Board.

. (4) Nothingsn this section shall entitle any person against whom
a detention otder has been made to appear by any legal practitioner in
any matter connected with the reference to the Advisory Board; and
the proceedings of the Advisory Board and its report, excepting the
partof the report which the opinion of the Advisory Board is specified,
shall be confidential.

12. Action upon the report of the Advisory Board- (/) In
any case where the Advisory Board has reported that there is, in its
opinion, sufficient cause for the detention of a person, the appropriate
Government may confirm the detention order and continue the
detention of the person concerned for such period as it thinks fit.

(2) In any case where the Advisory Board has reported that
there is, in its opinion, no sufficient cause for the deteniion of a person,
the appropriate Government shall revoke the detention of a person,
the appropriate Government shall revoke the detention order and cause
the person concerned to be released forthwith.

13. Maximum period of detention- The maximum period
which any person may be detained in pursuance of any detention

order which has been confirmed under Section 12 shall be twelve
months from the date of detention:



38

Proyided that nothing.contained jn this Section;shall affect:the.
POWET() l,',mcrapp}‘.qpljatﬁ.iGOVGI'Ilmen[ to revoke or modify the detention |
order &Qtf%'1){!¢arliﬂf HWIRS 1o z196) (s o S8} IR

14, Reyocation of detention oxders- (1) Without,prejudice o
the provisions of Section 21 of the General Clauses-Act. 1897 (10 of
18977), a detention order may, at any|lime, be revoked or modified,-

.1+ (a) notyithstanding that the order has been made, by an officer.

jg e B Bt i |

mentioned in Sub-section (3) of Section 3, by the State Government
to which,that; officer is subordinatg ot by the Central Govemment;'
- (b)mnotwithstanding that, the order has been made by a State
Government, by the Central Government,
s c(2)The revogation or expiry, of a detention order under Section
3 againgt t,_he same person in any case where fresh facts have arisen
after the date .,of revocation or expity on which the Central Government
o State Gavernment or an officer mentioned in Sub-section (3) of ‘
Section 3i as:the ,g:;asgz-.,_r.riay, be, is satisfied that such an order should be | :
made.bisod vio: LI, it liy
5el) o k4 Ae Cireumstances, in-which person may be detained for'
periods donger: than three months without obtaining the gpinion
of Advisory Boards- (/) Notwithstanding anything contained in'the
fmegping-ggggis@qnsi@f;gshigs Act, or injany judgmentydecree or order .~
ofijany gcourtpriother authority, any person in respect of whom arl-“’
ordgrofany court.on other authority, any person in respect of whom
aty orderofdetention-has been made under this Act at any timebefore
the ?[§th glayi of i June,i1989] may be detained without obtaining the
opinion ofithe AdyiseryBoard fora petiod tonger than three months,
but_ingylgjexqeeding six months, from the date of his detention where
sueh-person, had been detained with a view to preventing him, in any
disturbed,areas- « oiino
(i) from interfering with the efforts of Government in coping
£ with the terrorist and disruptive activities; and
. (i) from actingiin any manner prejudicial to-
(a) the defence of India; or
(b) the security of India; or

s A
AV LA O : T 4

Twn

33

(¢) the security of the State; or

(d) the maintenance of public order, or

(e) the maintenance of supplies and services essential to the

community. ® ‘

Section 3, 8 and 10.t0 14:shall have effect subject to the following
modifications, namely:

(a) in Sub-section (4), in the proviso,-

(A) for the words "ten days" the words "fifteen days" shall be
substituted;

(B) for the words
substituted;

(i) in Sub-section (5), for the words "seven days", the words

"fifteen days" shallsubstituted;

() in Section 8, in Sub-section (1), for the words "ten days”,
the words "fifteen days" shall be substituted;
(e)in.Section 10, for the words "shall, within three weeks", the
words "shall, within four months and two weeks" shall be substituted;

Ji(d) in Section 11,-
(i) in Sub-section (1), for the words

"ten days", the words " twenty days" shall be

"seven weeks", the words

tfive months and three weeks" shall be substituted;

(ii) in Sub-section (2), for the words "detention of the person
concerned", the words "continued detention of the person concerned”,
shall be substituted;

(e) in Section 12, for the words "for the detention", at both the
places where they occur, the words "for the continued detention” shall
be substituted;

~ (f)in Section 13, for the words "twelve months”, the words
"two years" shall be ,substituted:

(g) in Section 14, in the proviso to Sub-section (2), for the words
"welve months" the words " two years” shall be substituted.

15. Temporary release of persons detained- (/) The
appropriate Government may, at any time, direct that any person
detained in pursuance of a detention order may be released for any
specified period either without conditions or upon such conditions



34

specified in the direction as that person accepts, and may, at any time,
cancel his release. :

(2) In directing the release of any person under Sub-section (1),
the appropriate Government may require him to enter into a bond
with or without sureties for the due observance of the conditions
specified .,in the direction.

(3) Any person released under Sub-section (1), shall surrender
himself at the time and ,.place, and to the authority, specified in the
order directing his release or cancelling his release, as the case may
be.

(4) If any person fails without sufficient cause, to surrender
himself in the manner specified in Sub-section (3), he shall be
punishable with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two
years, or with fine, or with both. J

(5) If any person released under Sub-section (1) fails fulfil any,
of the conditions imposed upon him under the said Sub-section or in‘
the bond entered into by him, the bond shall be declared to be forfeited
and any person bound thereby shall be liable to pay the penalty thereo

16. Protection of a action taken in good faith= No suit ol
legal proceeding shall lie against the Central Government or a State
Government, and no suit, prosecution or other legal proceeding shal
lic against any person, for anything in good faith done or intendedto
be done in pursuance of this Act. 5

17. Act not to have effect with respect to detentions under
State laws- () Nothing in this Act shall‘apply or have any effect with
respect to orders of detention, made under many State Jaw, which are
in force immediately before the commencement Of the National
Security Ordinance, 1980 (11 of 1980), and accordingly every person
in respect of whom an order of detention.made under any State law i$
in force immediately before such commencement, shall be Governed
with respect to such detention by the provisions of such State law
where the State law under which such order of detention is made is an
Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as the State Ordinance) promulgated
by the Governor of the State and the State Ordinance has been

35

replaced-

(i) before such commencement, by an enactment passed by the
Legislature of the State, by such elzaci.ment; or :

(ii) after such commencement, by an enactment which is passed
by the Legislature of the State and the application of which is confined
to orders of detention’ made before such commencement under the
State Ordinance, by such enactment,

as if this Act had not been enacted.

(2) Nothing in this section be deemed to bar the making under
Section 3/ of a detention order against any person referred to in
Subsection (1) after the detention order in force in respect of him as
aforesaid immediately/before the commencement of the National
Security Ordnanee; 1980 (11 of 1980), ceases to have effect for any
reason ' whatsoever. '

Explanation - For the purposes of this Section, " State law"
means.any law providing for preventive detention on all or any of the
grounds on which an order of detention may be under Sub-section
(2) ofSection 3 and in force in any State immediately before the
commencement of said Ordinance.

18. Repeal and saving- (/) The National Security Ordinance,
1980 (11 of 1980), is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the $aid Ordinance shall be deemed to have been dene or
taken under he corresponding provisions of this Act, asif this Act had
come into force on the 23rd day of September, 1980, and in particular,
any reference made under Section 10 of the said Ordinance and pending
before any Advisory Board immediately before the date on which
this Act receives the assent of the President may continue to be dealt
with by that Board after that date as if such Board had been constituted
under Section 9 of the Act.

U



36

ANNEXURE - 1V

(Supreme Court's instruction to the Armed forces Operating under AFSP
Act. 1958)
Para 54: Listof Lo 's and Don'ts while Providing Aid to Civil Authorities

Do's

1. Actin closest possible communication with civil authorities throughout.
2. Maintain intercommunication if possible by telephone/radio.

3. Get the permission/requisition from the Magistrate when present.

4. Use the litte force and do as little injury to person and property as may

consistent with attainment of objective in view.

5. In case you decide to open fire-

(a) give warning in local language that fire will be effective,

(b) attract attention before firing by bugle or other means,

(c) distribute your in fire units with specificd commanders,

(d) control fire by issuing personal orders,

(e) note number of rounds fired,

(f) aim at the front of crowd actually rioting and inciting to riot/or as

conspicuous ring-leaders, i.e. ., donot fire into the think of the crowd atthe back.

(g) aim low and shoot for effect,

(h) keep Light Machine Gun and Medium gun in reserve,

(1) cease firing immediately once the object has been attamed
(j) take immediate steps to secure wounded. 3 !

6. Mamtam cordial relations with Civilian authorities, and Para mlhtary

I

forces. ¢

7. Ensure high standard of discipline. T
Don't's g W,
8. Do not use excessive force
9. Do not get involved in hand to hand struggle wi'th the mob.
10. Do not ill treat anyone, in particular, woman and. children.
11. No harassment of civilians. ‘ i
12. No torture. iy ‘
13. No communal bias while dealing with cmllans
14. No meddling in civilian administration affairs.
15. No military disgrace by loss/sutrender of weapons.
16. No not accept presents, donations and rewards.
17. Avoid indiscriminate firing.

wiRa wiw Aifies afyst=

2 AEAIRPFIRNY SERF-GAKT FAI I 2

I ST A ARFRE, S Ao, A I, GRETET - 2 & 9 7% AT 24T A
A G AFIFIE TE 61, csgisisl SEeE, S, Sl - o © yfae ] )

@ - vEIE|






